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In this new DVD/book/CD set Brad Davis teaches you how to add the blues to your flatpicking repertoire
and how to introduce the blues feel to the flatpicking tunes you already know. In this comprehensive course
you will learn the scales, rhythm styles, and chord progressions which define the blues, standard blues licks
and phrases, and blues styles of players like Robert Johnson, Eric Clapton, and Stevie Ray Vaughn. Brad
even demonstrates how to play Bill Monroe’s bluesy mandolin licks on the guitar. Elements of the blues can
be found in all forms of American music—from bluegrass, to folk, to rock. On the DVD Brad demonstrates
how to play several different arrangements of 12-bar blues rhythm and then shows you how to utilize the
blues scales to improvise over the chord progression. This is done in a step-by-step easy to follow method
through a variety of written examples in the book and opportunities for you to practice with the practice
tracks on the audio CD. The audio CD also contains ear training lessons in the context of the blues! The goal
of this book/DVD/CD set is not only to show you the elements of the blues, but to teach you how to be an
improvisational player in the context of the blues so that you can jump into any blues jam and hold your
own. Additionally, Brad teaches “bluesy” arrangements of a number of standard flatpicking fiddle tunes
(Nine Pound Hammer, Lonesome Road Blues, Salt Creek, John Hardy). If you are tired of playing the same
old deedle-deedle-deedle arrangements of fiddle tunes on the guitar, this course will help get you out of that
rut! This course is also supported by a web site containing answers to homework problems, ear training,
rhythm tracks, blues tunes and licks, and much more.
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From reader reviews:

Holly Flynn:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than other is
high. In your case who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this Flatpicking The Blues book
as nice and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Shawn Hunter:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Flatpicking The Blues e-book written by
well-known writer who knows well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who all read the
book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your
own hunger then you still doubt Flatpicking The Blues as good book not just by the cover but also with the
content. This is one publication that can break don't determine book by its cover, so do you still needing one
more sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have to
listening to a different sixth sense.

Joyce Jacobs:

The book untitled Flatpicking The Blues contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains your ex
idea with easy way. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read
that. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new period of time of literary
works. You can easily read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or device, so you can
read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can
open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice examine.

Kenneth Kan:

This Flatpicking The Blues is new way for you who has fascination to look for some information because it
relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or else you
who still having small amount of digest in reading this Flatpicking The Blues can be the light food to suit
your needs because the information inside this particular book is easy to get by means of anyone. These
books create itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book application form.
People who think that in book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is
not any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for
you actually. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book variety for your better life as well as knowledge.
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